BIDS RECEIPT REGISTER
CLOSING DATE: 11 FEBRUARY 2025

EDET 305/2024: APPOINTMENT FOR PHYSICAL SECURITY SERVICES AT VARIOUS SITES
(CLUSTER 4, 8, 9 AND 10) OF THE LIMPOPO ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT ENVIRONMENT

LIMPOPO

PROVINCIAL GOVERNMENT

REPUBLIC OF SOUTH AFRICA

CLOSING TIME: 11HO0

AND TOURISM FOR A PERIOD OF THIRTY-SIX (36) MONTHS

CLUSTER 4

No. | SUPPLIER NAME:

PRICE

CAREWELL HOLDINGS

R7 650 807.47

2 CALVIN & FAMILY SECURITY

R6 114 376.78

3 TRUST ONE GUARD SECURITY

R5 513 857.78

4 DITIRO TSAKA SECURITY

R5 676 520.92

5 KAN SECURITY SOLUTION

R6 251 673.79

6 HLIMBY| TRADING ENTERPRISE

R5 184 353.28

RATITO HOLDINGS (PTY) LTD

R4 062 887.00

CURE-O-GUARDS

R7 330 604.22

09 | MAZIBUKU SECURITY & PROJECTS

R6 276 844.29

10 PETKAY TRADING ENTERPRISE

R6 066 820.97

11 NOKO MD SECURITY SERVICES

R7 609 707.50

12 | MOLEBOGENG SECURITY SERVICES

R6 707 535.08

13 MAROMOFASE SECURITY

R4 076 254.68




ANNEXURE C

14 | MUGHWENA TRADING

R6 500 104.70

15 | KTS GENERAL TRADER

R7 128 202.32

16 | MBN SECURITY AND PROJECTS

R6 050 324.56

17 | BUKHOSI AM (PTY) LTD

R7 038 741.34

18 | DKH TRADING ENTERPRISE

R3 443 865.10

19 | BOLALE PROTECTION SERVICES

R 5203 200.00

20 | 4US 2 C SECURITY COMPANY

R6 970 404.32

21 MPHEPHU SECURITY SERVICES

R6 710 542.84

22 | IMMEDIATE FORCES SECURITY

R6 435 419.65

23 SEWELARA SECURITY AND CLEANING

R8 809 054.25

24 BOLEDI CONSTRUCTION

R7 714 402.59

25 | PRIME AFRICAN SECURITY

R8 461 626.77

26 | ZIWAPHI CRIME PREVENTION

R6 338 121.06

27 | CYTOLUX SECURITY

R6 016 184.85

28 MOKONDELELO PROTECTION SERVICES

R5 377 035.14

29 | VITAL FORCE PROTECTIVE

R1 455 844.68

30 | CS SECURITY

R7 395 765.00

31 IMMAQYELATE SECURITY

R5 442 677.76

EDET 305/2024: APPOINTMENT FOR PHYSICAL2  SECURITY SERVICES AT VARIOUS SITES (CLUSTER 4, 8, 9 AND
10) OF THE LIMPOPO ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT ENVIRONMENT AND TOURISM FOR A PERIOD OF THIRTY-SIX
(36) MONTHS



ANNEXURE C

32 | LB &T SECURITY R3 974 178.13
33 | BLUE MAGNOLIA SECURITY R5 721 877.99
34 | MC TEE HOLDINGS R5 578470.36
35 | SECURELIFE SECURITY SERVICES R6 506 287.27
36 | BENTA TRADING (PTY) LTD R4 375 350.00
37 | CHINABE SECURITY SERVICES R5 853 455.97
38 | GAP MANAGEMENT PART & PARTZ R6 770 782.01
39 | VISION TRADING R6 453 680.73
40 | VINCENTS CONSTRUCTION R6 058 972.80
41 | BOKA TAU HOLDINGS R4 987 698.74
42 | OMPWA TRADING ENTERPRISE R6 115 721.07
43 | INFRANITE SECURITY SOLUTIONS R7 330 604.21
44 | MALOPE A PHAHLA TRADING & PROJECTS CC R6 158 566.31
45 | NKFC SECURITY & PROJECTS CC R5 529 961.92
46 | DITEBOGO UNIT SECURITY R5 525 828.10
47 | MAREBOLE SECURITY SOLUTIONS R6 293 889.95
48 | MOKHALABONE SECURITY R5 538 280.08
49 | TUBATSE SECURITY SERVICES R8 469 011.42

EDET 305/2024: APPOINTMENT FOR PHYSICAL3
10) OF THE LIMPOPO ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

(36) MONTHS

SECURITY SERVICES AT VARIOUS SITES (CLUSTER 4, 8, 9 AND
ENVIRONMENT AND TOURISM FOR A PERIOD OF THIRTY-SIX



ANNEXURE C

50 | NO WAY TO RUN SECURITY

R6 577 814.14

51 | BLUE PRINT SECURITY

R7 469 899.51

52 | MONIKA SECURITY SERVICES

R534 837.18

53 | EBL TACTICAL SECURITY SERVICES

R2 647 774.87

54 | PHUTHADICHABA TRADING

R7 601 574.36

55 | TACTICAL SECURITY SERVICES

R6 928 704.00

56 | EZINGENI SECURITY AND CLEANING

R6 137 035.94

57 MAKGOBATHE SECURITY SERVICES

R7 167 611.81

58 | ARCTIC FOX SECURITY

R6 058 972.80

59 NEP SECURITY SERVICES

NO AMOUNT

60 MAHLAKOMMONI SECURITY

R6 058 972.80

61 | LELEDU SECURITY SERVICES

R7 170 923.52

62 MATHABANG TRADING AND PROJECTS

R 1929 046.19

63 | FHATU AND SON SECURITY

RNO AMOUNT

EDET 305/2024: APPOINTMENT FOR PHYSICAL4
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ANNEXURE C

CLUSTER 8
No. | SUPPLIER NAME: PRICE
1 R6 063 095.46
EZINGENI SECURITY & CLEANING
2 R6 058 972.80
MAHLAKOMMONI SECURITY SERVICE
3 DKH TRADING ENTERPRISE R3 296 442.24
4 PHUTHADICHABA TRADING ENTERPRISE R7 601 574.36
5 MPHEPHU SECURITY SERVICES R6 710 574.54
6 VISION TRADING PTY LTD R6 453 680.73
7 R6 058 912.80
ARCTIC FOX SECURITY
8 R5 828 612.36
BLUE MAGNOLIA TRADING
09 | MAREBOLE SECURITY SOLUTIONS
R6 293 889.95
10 | CALVIN & FAMILY SECURITY SERVICE R6 070 010.75
11 | MAZIBUKU SECURITY & PROJECTS R6 276 844.29
12 | BENTA TRADING (PTY) LTD R4 333 680.00
13 | VINCENT'S CONSTRUCTION & DEVELOPMENT R6 058 972.80
14 | CURE-O-GUARDS (PTY) LTD R7 330 604.22
15 | CYTOLUX R6 016 184.85
16 | IMMEDIATE FORCES SECURITY R6 331 608.66
17 | KTS GENERAL TRADER R7 128 202.32

EDET 305/2024: APPOINTMENT FOR PHYSICALS
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ANNEXURE C

18 | RATITO HOLDINGS (PTY) LTD R8 125 775.59
19 | NKFC SECURITY AND PROJECT R5 529 961.92
20 | BOLALE PROTECTION SERVICES R2 620 807.20
21 | OMPWA TRADING ENTERPRISE R6 115 721.07
22 | MOGALAGADI SECURITY R6 355 440.00
23 | TRUST ON GUARD SECURITY R5 513 857.78
24 | BOKATAU HOLDING (PTY) LTD R4 578 377.67
25 | MC TEE HOLDINGS (PTY) LTD R5 578 470.36
26 | NEP SECURITY SERVICES R12 001 751.88
27 | MAKGOBATHE SECURITY SERVICES R7 167 611.81
28 | TUBATSE SECURITY SERVICES R8 398 631.70
29 | MARUMOFASE SECURITY (PTY) LTD R5 435 006.31
30 | SECURELIFE SECURITY SERVICE R650 362.93
31 | PRIME AFRICAN SECURITY R8 184 844.58
32 | MOLEBOGENG SECURITY SERVICE R6 707 535.08
33 | FHATU AND SON SECURITY (PTY) LTD R5 011 200.00
34 | CS SECURITY GUARDING SERVICES R7 308 756.00
35 | DITIRO TSAKA SECURITY SERVICES R5 696 520.92
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ANNEXURE C

36 | KAN SECURITY SOLUTIONS R6 251 673.79
37 | EMMAQUELATE SECURITY R5 442 677.76
38 | MOKHALABONE SECURITY (PTY) R5 442 677.76
39 | SEWELARA SECURITY AND CLEANING R8 809 054.25
40 | MUGHWENA TRADING PROJECT R6 500 104.70
41 | 4US 2 C SECURITY (PTY)LTD R6 833 729.89
42 | LELEDU SECURITY SERVICES R7 170 923.52
43 | LION KING SECURITY SERVICES R5 928 143.16
44 | TACTICAL SECURITY SERVICES R6 928 704.00
45 | BUKHOSI AM (PTY) LTD R7 038 701.34
46 | DITEBOGO UNIT SECURITY SERVICES R5 499 725.40
47 | HLIMBYI TRADING ENTERPRISE R5 184 353.28
48 | ZIWAPHI CRIME PREVENTION R6 338 121.06
49 | NMR SECURITY SOLUTIONS R5677 178.13
50 | EBL TACTICAL SECURITY SERVICES R5 315 982.59
51 | CHINABE SECURITY SERVICES LTD R5 832 395.14
52 | BOLEDI CONSTRUCTION R7 714 402.59
53 | CAREWELL HOLDINGS (PTY) LTD R7 594 731.77

EDET 305/2024: APPOINTMENT FOR PHYSICAL7
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ANNEXURE C

54 | NO WAY TO RUN SECURITY SERVICES R6 577 781.14
55 | MAMAYILA TRADING ENTERPRISE R7 092 234.00
56 | MOKONDELLELO PROTECTION R5 377 035.14
57 | NOKOMD SECURITY SERVICES R7 526 907.50
58 | MBN SECURITY AND PROJECTS R6 032 836.75
59 | MALOPE A PHAHLA TRADING AND PROJECTS R6 158 566.31
60 | BLUEPRINT ASSOCIATES R6 256 458.30
61 | VITAL FORCE PROTECTIVE SERVICES R14 055 898.26
62 | MONIKA SECURITY SERVICES R534 837.18
63 | MATHABANG TRADING & PROJECTS R5 515 934.80
64 | GAP MANAGEMENT (PTY) LTD R6 728 675.38
CLUSTER9
No. | SUPPLIER NAME: PRICE
1 R7 167 611.81
MAKGOBATHE SECURITY SERVICES
2 R4 950 690.86
CALVIN & FAMILY SECURITY SERVICES (PTY) LTD
3 OMPWA TRADING ENTERPRISE R5 201 808.83
4 PETKAY TRADING ENTERPRISE R5 091 322.33
5 R6 366 970.58
ARCTIC FOX SECURITY

EDET 305/2024: APPOINTMENT FOR PHYSICALS
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6 NMR SECURITY SOLUTIONS (PTY) LTD R3 677 178.13
7 R6 710 542.54
MPHEPHU SECURITY SERVICES
8 R5 184 353.28
HLIMBY| TRADING ENTERPRISE
09 | ZIWAPHI CRIME PREVENTION R6 338 121.06
10 | BOLEDI CONSTRUCTION R7 714 402.59
11 | VINCENT CONSTRUCTION AND DEVELOPMENT R6 058 972.80
12 | MAHLAKOMMONI SECURITY SERVICES R6 058 972.80
13 | EBL TACTICAL SECURITY SERVICES R5 443 803.65
14 | BENTA TRADING (PTY) LTD R4 167 000.00
15 | MARUMOFASE SECURITY (PTY) LTD R5 239 900.77
16 | KAN SECURITY SOLUTIONS R6 251 673.79
17 | MUGHWENA TRADING PROJECTS R6 500 104.70
18 | VITAL FORCE PROTECTIVE R13 503 302.89
19 | 4US 2 C SECURITY (PTY) LTD R4 864 073.82
20 | EZINGENI SECURITY AND CLEANING (PTY) LTD R5 915 214.49
21 | SECURELIFE SECURITY SERVICE R6 506 211.61
22 | CHINABE SECURITY SERVICES (PTY) LTD R5 790 237.47
23 | MOLEBOGENG SECURITY SERVICES R6 707 535.08
24 | MOKHALABONE SECURITY (PTY) LTD R5 538 220.08

EDET 305/2024: APPOINTMENT FOR PHYSICAL9
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ANNEXURE C

25 | DKH TRADING ENTERPRISE R2 969 784.96
26 | MOKONDELLELO PROTECTION SERVICE R5 377 035.14
27 | COLLINS SEBOLA FINANCIAL SERVICES R7 134 738.00
28 | IMMEDIATE FORCES SECURITY R5 121 757.11
29 | BOLALE PROTECTION SERVICES R5 251 209.60
30 | EMMAQUELATE SECURITY R5 442 677.76
31 | KTS GENERAL TRADER R7 128 202.32
32 | MBN SECURITY AND PROJECTS R5 997 862.06
33 | MAZIBUKU SECURITY & PROJECTS R6 276 844.29
34 | CYTOLUX SECURITY R6 016 184.85
35 | SEWELARA SECURITY AND CLEANING R8 809 054.25
36 | TACTICAL SECURITY SERVICES LIMPOPO R6 004 512.00
37 | CURE-O-GUARDS (PTY) LTD R7 330 604.22
38 | RATITO HOLDINGS (PTY) LTD R8 125 775.59
39 | DITEBOGO UNIT SECURITY SERVICES R5 447 520.00
40 | MUTAPA SECURITY SERVICES & LOGISTICS R4 807 990.40
41 | MALOPE A PHAHLA SECURITY SERVICES R6 158 566.31
42 | TRUST ONE GUARD SECURITY SERVICES R5 513 857.78

EDET 305/2024: APPOINTMENT FOR PHYSICAL10
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(36) MONTHS

SECURITY SERVICES AT VARIOUS SITES (CLUSTER 4, 8, 9 AND
ENVIRONMENT AND TOURISM FOR A PERIOD OF THIRTY-SIX



ANNEXURE C

43 | PRIME AFRICA SECURITY R9 208 499.33
44 | GAP MANAGEMENT (PTY) LTD R6 604 837.93
45 | NKFC SECURITY AND PROJECTS CC R5 529 961.92
46 | MOGALAGADI SECURITY (PTY) LTD R3 177 720.00
47 | MC TEE HOLDINGS (PTY) LTD R5 578 470.36
48 | LELEDU SECURITY SERVICES R7 170 923.52
49 | NEP SECURITY SERVICES (PTY) R9 925 627.57
50 | PHUTHADICHABA TRADING ENTERPRISE R7 601 574.36
51 | MAREBOLE SECURITY SOLUTIONS R4 140 717.07
52 | BOKA TAU HOLDINGS (PTY) LTD R4 891 791.84
53 | BUKHOSI AM (PTY) LTD R6 786 313.08
54 | TFK GENERAL SERVICES R5 538 528.00
55 | NO WAY TO RUN SECURITY SEERVICES R6 577 781.14
56 | BLUE MAGNOLIA TRADING 50 CC R5 646 528.73
57 | CAREWELL HOLDINGS 5 (PTY) LTD R7 482 580.36
58 | BLUEPRINT SECURITY R7 469 899.51
59 | MONIKA SECURITY SERVICES R534 837.18

60 | MATHABANG TRADING AND PROJECTS R5 515 934.80

EDET 305/2024: APPOINTMENT FOR PHYSICAL11 SECURITY SERVICES AT VARIOUS SITES (CLUSTER 4, 8, 9 AND
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CLUSTER 10

ANNEXURE C

No. | SUPPLIER NAME:

PRICE

EZINGENI SECURITY AND CLEANING (PTY) LTD

R7 689 706.47

2 PHUTHADICHABA TRADING ENTERPRISE

R9 501 967.94

3 KAN SECURITY SOLUTIONS

R6 512 160. 20

4 ZIWAPHI CRIME PREVENTION

R7 483 796.08

MAZIBUKU SECURITY AND PROJECTS

R7 846 055.34

6 DKH TRADING ENTERPRISE

R703 527.26

7 SECURELIFE SECURITY SERVICES

R3 253 181.46

8 MPHEPHU SECURITY SERVICES (PTY) LTD

R8 388 178.18

09 | PRIME AFRICAN SECURITY

R15 240 593.59

10 | HLIMBYI TRADING ENTERPRISE

R6 480 441.60

11 MAHLAKOMMONI SECURITY SERVICES

R6 058 972.80

12 | ARCTIC FOX SECURITY

R7 573 716.00

13 IMMEDIATE FORCES SECURITY

R6 983 868.92

14 | MAMAYILA TRADING ENTERPRISE

R8 048 332.50

15 BENTA TRADING

R5 542 110.00

16 LELEDU SECURITY SERVICES

R8 963 654.40

17 | VINCENTS CONSTRUCTION AND DEVELOPMENT

R7 573 716.00

EDET 305/2024: APPOINTMENT FOR PHYSICAL12 SECURITY SERVICES AT VARIOUS SITES (CLUSTER 4, 8, 9 AND
10) OF THE LIMPOPO ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT ENVIRONMENT AND TOURISM FOR A PERIOD OF THIRTY-SIX

(36) MONTHS



ANNEXURE C

18 | GUBIS85 R800 890.61

19 | MOKONDELLELO PROTECTION SERVICES R6 721 293.93
20 | VITAL FORCE PROTECTION SERVICES R17 984 367.19
21 | NMR SECURITY SOLUTIONS R7 096 472.68
22 | MATAPA SECURITY SERVICES R6 479 500.80
23 | OMPWA TRADING ENTERPRISE R6 959 217.15
24 | BUKHOSI AM (PTY) LTD R7 719 550.04
25 | PETKAY TRADING ENTERPRISE R6 870 675.14
26 | MAZAXA CONSTRUCTION AND PROJECTS R7 564 233.60
27 | GAP MANAGEMENT (PTY) LTD R8 481 746.89
28 | BOKA TAU HOLDINGS (PTY) LTD R6 208 794.91
29 | MOLEBOGENG SECURITY SERVICES R8 384 418.84
30 | SEWELARA SECURITY AND CLEANING R11 011 317.82
31 | 4US 2 C SECURITY (PTY) LTD R7 079 480.74
32 | KTS GENERAL TRADER R8 910 252.90
33 | MBN SECURITY AND PROJECTS (PTY) R7 567 277.58
34 | MOKHALABONE SECURITY (PTY) LTD R6 922 775.38
35 | MALOPE A PHAHLA TRADING AND PROJECTS R7 698 207.99
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ANNEXURE C

36 | MAKGOBATHE SECURITY SERVICES

R8 959 514.76

37 | TACTICAL SECURITY SERVICES

R7 967 736.00

38 | NKFC SECURITY AND PROJECTS CC

R6 912 451.80

39 | EMMAQUELATE SECURITY

R6 803 347.20

40 | BLUE MAGNOLIA TRADING 50 CC

R6 437 111.97

41 | GEORGE B SECURITY SERVICES

R7 267 235.42

42 | NO WAY TO RUN SECURITY SERVICES

R8 222 225.42

43 MAREBOLE SECURITY SOLUTION (PTY)

R6 252 482.78

44 | NEP SECURITY SERVICES

R12 213 400.19

45 MOGALAGADI SECURITY

R3 177 720.00

46 COLLINS SEBOLA FINANCIAL SERVICES

R9 266 458.50

47 | MC TEE HOLDINGS (PTY) LTD

R5 578 470.36

48 MUGHWENA TRADING PROJECT

R8 125 130.88

49 | CALVIN & FAMILY SECURITY SERVICES

R4 950 690.86

50 BOLALE PROTECTION SERVICES

R6 564 012.00

51 | DITEBOGO UNIT SECURITY SERVICES

R2 773 440.00

52 | CYTOLUX

R4 512 138.64

53 MARUMOFASE SECURITY (PTY) LTD

R6 647 428.71
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ANNEXURE C

54 | RATITO HOLDINGS

R9 683 052.90

55 | BOLEDI CONSTRUCTION

R7 714 402.59

56 | CHINABE SECURITY SERVICES (PTY) R7 322 085.17
57 | CURE-O-GUARDS (PTY) LTD R763 604.61

58 | TRUST ONE GUARD SECURITY SERVICES R4 135 393.32
59 | RIGAYISI DEVELOPMENT SERVICES R7 983 423.00

60 | SCORPIUS 1104 SECURITY

R 10 352 189.80

61 CARE WELL HOLDINGS 5 (PTY)

R9 577 528.27

62 | MONICA SECURITY SERVICES

R898 007.99

63 BLUEPRING SECURITY

R9 555 064.01

64 | CHARLEY-TITE SECURITY R6 408 000.00

65 | MATHABANG TRADING AND PROJECTS R9 306 226.24
ALL CLUSTERS

No. | SUPPLIER NAME: PRICE

1 GANN TRADING CC R22 362 235.20

2 R32 455 932.90
CHASBA PROJECTS

3 THREE SIXTY DEGREES SECURITIES R13 132 800.00

4 VITAL FORCE PROTECTIVE SERVICES (PTY) LTD R 60 102012.02
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ANNEXURE C

5 LIFE AT ITS BEST ENTERPRISE (PTY) LTD R26 526 661.02
6 DIYATA DITSHABA (PTY) LTD R22 461 388.56
7 R23 461 388.56
THABO YA LETSATSI TRADING AND PROJECTS

8 INFRA LOGIC SECURITY SERVICES R30 088 270.67
09 | MODISE PROTECTION SERVICES R2 079 335.12
10 | THE GROUPS (PTY) LTD R20 232 888.48
11 | 1 SOLUTIONS INNOVATION GROUP T/A NWS R20 196 000.00
12 | TOUHG SECURITY SERVICES (PTY) LTD R30 462 964.33
13 | RESOLVE TRADING 143 CC R23 403 712.32
14 | MAHOSI PROTECTION SECURITY SERVICES R44 8085.63

15 | RED ANT SECURITY RELOCATION & EVICTION SERVICES | R83 411 17.48
16 | HLOGOTLOU PROJECTS MANAGEMENT R22 298 546.40
17 | LELOBA BRIGHT TRADING (PTY) LTD R20 646 194.66
18 | DIKGAETSEDI TRADING AND PROJECTS R28 428 424.08
19 | THABELI SECURITY SERVICES R28 428 424.08
20 | M GUARD (PTY) LTD R11 762 351.85
21 | SEBENZANI TRADING 302 T/A G2S SECURITY R26 338 092.39
22 | JAEB INVESTMENTS (PTY) LTD R27 702 182.10
23 | LETABA SECURITY (PTY) LTD R27 171 549.17
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24 | HWIBIDU GROUP R23 532 376.32
25 | GREY SECURITY SERVICES R24 554 960.19
26 | NIST INVESTMENTS R25 695 857.88
27 | BJM SECURITY AND PROJECTS (PTY) LTD R24 869 495.46
28 | OB SECURITY AND PROJECTS (PTY) LTD R22 134 492.06
29 | MUSHOMA SECURITY SERVICES AND PROJECTS R23 725 916.01
30 | MTSS TRAINING AND SECURITY R25 589 981.65
31 | MUTHUMUNI CONSTRUCTION AND PROJECTS R22 357 114.56
32 | LETIQA TWINS TRADING (PTY) LTD R30 463 890.73
33 | WOWO TRADING 7 PROJECTS R22 706 076.96
34 | XILOTA PROJECTS & PROJECTS R24 505 696.64
35 | RAMADIMETJA SECURITY CC R24 848 913.86
36 | DAN PROTECTION SERVICES (PTY) LTD R22 130 441.64
37 | VHUGI PROTECTION SERVICES ( PTY) LTD R22 213 477.80
38 | R5 SECURITY SERVICES R17 045 661.60
39 | BOLLE TECHNOLOGIES R22 029 644.92
40 | KMT SECURITY AND EVENTS R22 895 730.60
41 | KGABA’S LOGISTICS AND PROJECTS R39 816 000.00
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42 | THE LADY BOSS SECURITY SERVICE R25 841 529.30
43 | MARHUMBINI SECURITY GUARDS AND CONTROL R27 866 210.40
44 | NKHENSI CAROL SECURITY TRADING R24 256 658.77
45 | NTABASI BUSINESS TRADING R30 214 476.00
46 | MARSHALL NIGHTS SERVICES R32 692 534.69
47 | RISE SECURITY SERVICES R25 250 515.68
48 | TSHIKALANGE SECURITY SERVICES R20 378 306.88
49 | BUMOSE PROJECTS R32 943 364.79
50 | DEPHETOGO CLEANING & SECURITY R52 145 488.68
51 | RAY BEE TRADING ENTERPRISE R23 533 181.00
52 | UDO LA TSHABIKO SECURITY SERVICE R28 112 596.06
53 | DETSHITEVHU TRADING AND PROJECTS R22 400 123.04
54 | KGOSIMONENE GENERAL SERVICES R21 470 840.99
55 | IMMACULATE MANAGEMENT SERVICES R26 308 810.73
56 | MUPONI PROPERTY MANAGEMENT R13 640 882.00
57 | MMUSHO SECURITY AND PROJECTS R19 066 320.00
58 | SHINNING STAR SECURITY & PROJECTS R25 798 962.00
59 | MUTWANAMBA SECURITY SERVICES JV MAWIKA R26 763 261 .84

EDET 305/2024: APPOINTMENT FOR PHYSICAL18 SECURITY SERVICES AT VARIOUS SITES (CLUSTER 4, 8, 9 AND
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60 | FEPANG PROTECTION GROUP R24 416 724.64
61 | MOKGDI DITLA LOKA ENTERPRISE R19 675 188.00
62 | BRAVO PROJECTS R19 675 188.00
63 | SKONYE TRADING ENTERPRISE R22 463 512.08
64 | PRISTO RESPONSE TRADING (PTY) LTD R28 022 164.03
65 | DITIRO TSAKA SECURITY SERVICES R6 408 586.03
66 | LESEDI GUARDING AND TRADING R15 957 875.24
67 | PT WOOD SOLUTIONS PROJECTS R23 973 959.70
68 | MODUBANYE TRADING ENTERPRISE R23 295 780.00
69 | KGOMAGANANG BUSINESS ENTERPRISE CC RNO BID PRICE
70 | GIJA SECURITY AND PROJECTS R21 491 081.14
71 | GOG SECURITY AND PROJECTS R24 378 014.36
72 | DOUBLE BARELL SECURITY SERVICE NO BID PRICE
73 | GEMINI ELEMENT (PTY) LTD R23 811 471.31
74 | MAGREEN SECURITY SERVICES (PTY) LTD R6 524 928.27
75 | 888 PMS SECURITY SERVICES R6 524 928.27
76 | SUECOLL RENTING JV TILOCLIFF ARMED NO BID PRICE
77 | LETTIE TOP SECURITY R20 793 35.12
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78 | MAPHETO BUSINESS SERVICES CC R27 085 616.64
79 | TAKANA LIMPOPO (PTY) LTD R24 497 394.13
80 | KBMP PROTECTION SERVICES R23 836 090.30
81 | JACK-JACK SECURITY SERVICES CC NO BID PRICE
82 | WENZILE PHAPHAMA R32 639 494.40
83 | MABERET PROTECTION SERVICE R20 465 280.00
84 | MAFHATUTSHEDZWA PROTECTION SERVICES R31 679 768.38
85 | LINDILEX HOPE SECURITY AND TRAINING R24 887 712.91
86 | SNIPER SECURITY R26 102 700.00
87 | CLYLOTRIX (PTY)LTD R26 720 463.90
88 | SIHLOMILE SECURITY SERVICE R27 721 521.42
89 | ELDNA SECURITY SERVICE R21 817 800.00
90 | DINOKO MONYELA SECURITY SERVICE R21 420 000.00
91 | 6 POINT SECURITY SERVICE R24 462 000.00
92 | MGM VIP AND SECURITY SERVICES PTY NO BID PRICE
93 | ANNE SECURITY & TRADING R27 540 240.00
94 | NO NAME TRADING CC NO BID PRICE
95 | JUDY AND NEWIE PROJECTS R28 022 703.42
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96 | SEDIMA SECURITY AND CLEANING R22 361 495.40
97 | MANSAPHASE (PTY) LTD R10 001 079.62
98 | NKN SECURITY SERVICES JV R35 043 254.35
99 | DOUBLE OPTION TRADING 120 (PTY) LTD R6 713 760.37

100 | ECONOCOM 671 R20 561 853.86
101 | TASMANIAN SECURITY AND TRAINING R24 723 197.50
102 | LTONDI SECURITY & PROJECTS R21 354 437.37
103 | AKANI CORPORATE SOLUTIONS R33 564 318.40
104 | MHLAZIY ENTERPRISE R31 839 721.82
105 | RIAKONA TRADING ENTERPRISE R45 984 224.64
106 | MUTENDA SECURITY SERVICES JV MUFAROMASANA R28 260 279.50
107 | NEP SECURITY SERVICES NO BID PRICE
108 | MATOME & MOLOTO PROTECTION SERVICES R22 574 423.00
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